BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE VARIOUS CONTROLLED PARKING ZONES
CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No.3 2010

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of their powers under Sections 1,2, 3,4,
19, 32, 35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, 117 and 124
(1) (c) & (d) to the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the Act”) as amended and
Part 6 of the Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers hereby
make the above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the /Eé day of Aty
2010 and amend the Brighton & Hove Various Controlled Parking Zones (7/’
Consolidation Order 2008, as amended, as follows:-

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:

PART 10 - INDEX OF SCHEDULE |

Part | No Waiting Restrictions
Part 1.3 Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm:
Add the letter “Y” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part 2 No Loading/Unloading
Part 2.1 At Any Time :
Add the letter “R” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part 7 Doctors Parking Places
Part 7.2 8am to 8pm on any day
Add the letter “Y” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part 12 Loading Bays
Part 12.7 Mon - Sat 9am to 6pm 30 mins no return within | hour :
Add the letter “M” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part 12.11 Mon — Sun 9am to épm:
Add the letter “Y” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

After existing Part 12.12 add new Part to the Index as follows:
12,13 | Monday to Sunday 9am to 8pm R

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Controlled Parking Zone C

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem 37 Somerset Street: delete “26.4 metres” and substitute “15.9 metres”

Part 12.6 Loading Only Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm

Add new ltem 6a: Somerset Street — South side — From a point 21.9 metres west of
the western kerbline of Montague Place westwards for a distance of 16.9 metres —
CPZ“C”



Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete Item 3: Somerset Street - South side - From a point 32.4 metres west of the
western kerbline of Montague Place westwards for 7 metres

Controlled Parking Zone H

Part 4.1 Permit Parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am -8pm
inclusive
Amend Item 33 Crescent Place: delete “9 metres” and substitute “10.7 metres”

Add new Item 44a: Marine Parade — East side — (near properties Nos.109 - | 14)
From a point | metre north of the northern kerbline of Marine Parade northwards
for a distance of 10 metres — CPZ “H”

Add new Item 44b: Marine Parade — North side — (outside properties Nos. 109 —

I 14) Echelon parking at an angle of 60 degrees to the kerb. From a point 15.6
metres north of the northern kerbline of Marine Parade westwards for a distance of
7.6 metres — CPZ “H”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new Item 40a: Lewes Crescent — West side — From a point 32 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Chichester Terrace northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres
(outside No.3) — CPZ “H”

Part I1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete Item 10: Crescent Place — East side — From a point 6.7 metres north of the

northern kerbline of Marine Parade northwards for a distance of 3 metres

Controlled Parking Zone M

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am -8pm
inclusive

Amend ltem 38 Lansdowne Square: delete “6 metres” and substitute “5 metres”
delete “20.5 metres” and substitute “21.5 metres”

Amend Item 39 Lansdowne Square: delete “6 metres” and substitute “5 metres”
delete “21.5 metres” and substitute “22.5 metres”

Part 12.4 Loading Only from Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm
(for a period of | hour no return within 30 minutes)

Delete Item |: Lansdowne Place — West side — From a point 1.7 metres north of the
common boundary of Nos. 47 & 49 Lansdowne Place southwards for a distance of
{0 metres



After Part 12.6 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 12.7

Loading Only Monday - Saturday 9am to é6pm (for up to a period of 30
minutes, no return within | hour)

Item Side of o e
No. Street Name Road Description CPZ
I Lansdowne Place West From a point |.7 metres north of M

the common boundary of Nos. 47
& 49 Lansdowne Place southwards
for a distance of 10 metres

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend Item 39 Western Road: in column (3) after “excluding No.l” insert “, Flats
I,2 & 3 No.27A”. In column (4) after “No.1” insert *, Flats | to 3 No.272”

Controlled Parking Zone N

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Delete Item 12: Clarendon Villas — South side — At 30 degrees to the kerb, from a
point 146.6 metres west of the western kerbline of Goldstone Villas westwards for a
distance of 7 metres

Delete Item 50: Osborne Villas — West side — (outside |-8 Grosvenor Mansions)
From a point 24.1 metres south of the southern kerbline of Church Road
southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Delete Item 51: Osborne Villas — West side — From a point 136.3 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Church Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Controlled Parking Zone O

Part 4.2 Permit parking only from Monday to Saturday between 9am
and 8pm inclusive
Amend Item 51 Wilbury Crescent: delete “6 metres” and substitute “25.8 metres”

Add new Item 51a: Wilbury Crescent — South side — From a point 8.6 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Wilbury Villas eastwards for a distance of 6.7 metres — CPZ
“O’!

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay and
Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, with no return within 4
hours) from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm inclusive

Amend ltem | York Avenue: delete “10 metres” and substitute “9 metres”

Part 5.10 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period up to || hours) from Monday to Saturday
between 9am and 8pm inclusive

Delete existing Item 18: Wilbury Crescent



Add new ltem 18: Wilbury Crescent — North side — From a point 8.3 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Wilbury Villas eastwards for a distance of || metres — CPZ
“O”

Add new ltem [8a: Wilbury Crescent — North side — From a point 24.3 metres east
of the eastern kerbline of Wilbury Villas eastwards for a distance of 16.7 metres —
CPZ (LO'!

Add new Item 18b: Wilbury Crescent — North side — From a point 45.3 metres east

of the eastern kerbline of Wilbury Villas eastwards for a distance of 23.6 metres —
CPZ*“O”

Add new ltem [8c: Wilbury Crescent — North side From a point 76.2 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Wilbury Villas eastwards for a distance of 10.7 metres — CPZ
GLOH

Delete existing ltem 21: Wilbury Avenue — North side - Between a point 10 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of The Drive, and a point |16 metres west of the western
kerbline of Wilbury Villas.

Add new Item 21: Wilbury Avenue — North side — From a point 9.7 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of The Drive eastwards for a distance of 14.5 metres — CPZ
“O”

Add new Item 22: Wilbury Avenue — North side — From a point 34.1 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of The Drive eastwards for a distance of 14.2 metres — CPZ
“O”

Add new Item 23: Wilbury Avenue — North side — From a point 52.8 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of The Drive eastwards for a distance of 5.3 metres — CPZ “O”

Add new [tem 24: Wilbury avenue — North side — From a point 65.3 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of The Drive eastwards for a distance 10.6 metres — CPZ “O”

Add new Item 25: Wilbury Avenue — North side — From a point 82.8 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of The Drive eastwards for a distance of || metres — CPZ “O”

Add new ltem 26: Wilbury Avenue — North side — From a point 100.7 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of The Drive eastwards for a distance of 8.6 metres — CPZ “O”

Add new Item 27: Wilbury Avenue — North side — From a point 26.3 metres west of
the western kerbline of Wilbury Villas westwards for a distance of 45.5 metres —
CPZ “O”

Add new Item 28: Wilbury Avenue — North side — From a point 83.8 metres west of
the western kerbline of Wilbury Villas westwards for a distance of 12 metres — CPZ
“O”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem [7a Lyndhurst Road: delete “28.1 metres” and substitute “25.8 metres”



Part 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time

Add new ltem 55: Wilbury Crescent — North side — From a point 6.3 metres west of
the western kerbline of Bigwood Avenue westwards for a distance of 3 metres —
CPZ “O”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time

Amend Item | Avondale Road: delete “8 metres” and substitute “7 metres”

Delete Item 3: Lyndhurst Road — South side — From the western boundary of
No.104 Lyndhurst Road eastwards for a distance of 8 metres

Amend ltem 6 Wilbury Avenue: delete “16.5 metres” and substitute “15.3 metres’”
delete “8 metres” and substitute “| | metres”

Controlled Parking Zone Q

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay and
Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours)
from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm inclusive

Delete existing Item 8: Hamilton Road — West side - 2.0 metres wide. Between a
point 16 metres south of a prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Stanford Road
and a point |7 metres north of the northern kerbline of Old Shoreham Road

Add new Item 8: Hamilton Road — West side — From a point 8.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Brigden Street southwards for a distance of 24.8 metres — CPZ

l‘Q’!

Add new Item 8a: Hamilton Road — West side — From a point 5.5 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Brigden Street northwards for a distance of 24.2 metres —
CPZ “Q”

Add new ltem 8b: Hamilton Road — West side — From a point 29.7 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Bridgen Street northwards for a distance of 103.9 metres —
CPZ I‘Qil

Add new ltem 8c: Hamilton Road — West side — From a point 8.5 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Stanford Road southwards for a distance of | 1.2 metres —
CPZ l‘Q!’

Add new Item 8d: Hamilton Road — West side — From a point 36.7 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Stanford Road southwards for a distance of 20.3 metres —
CPZ (‘Q”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem | Belmont: delete “28.8 metres” and substitute “21.5 metres” delete
“|12 meters” and substitute “16.2 metres”

Delete Item la: Belmont — South side - from a point 22.2 metres east of the eastern
kerbline of Dyke Road eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres



Part 11.]1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend ltem 2 Brigden Street: delete “3 metres” and substitute “6 metres”

Controlled Parking Zone R

After Part 1.4 insert a new Part in the Scheduie as follows:
Part 2.1
No Loading At Any Time

Item Side of ..
No. Street Name Road Description CPZ

From the western kerbline of
| Portland Road South Westbourne Gart:!ens R
westwards for a distance of |5

metres

From the eastern kerbline of
2 Portland Road South Westbourne Gar.dens R
eastwards for a distance of 6.6

metres

From the southern kerbline of
3 Westbourne Gardens East Portland Road southwards for R
a distance of I 1.5 metres

From the southern kerbline of
4 Westbourne Gardens West Portland Road southwards for R
a distance of 10.5 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete Item 39a: Modena Road — West side - from a point 48 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Lawrence Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Delete Item 83: Sheridan Terrace — Western arm West Side — From the
prolongation of the northern boundary of property No.| southwards for a distance
of 6 metres

Part |1.] Motorcycles only At Any Time

Add new Item 34a: Portland Road — South side — From a point 52.6 metres west of
the western kerbline of Sackville Road westwards for a distance of 3 metres — CPZ
(‘R”

After Part 12.7 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 12.13
Loading Only from Monday to Sunday 9am to 8pm
::i':n Street Name Sl:ieagf Description CPZ
From a point 8 metres west of the
| Coleridge South | common boundary wall between Nos. R
Street 90 & 92 Coleridge Street westwards
for a distance of 7.6 metres




Controlled Parking Zone U

Part [ 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time

Add new ltem 4a: St Luke’s Terrace — South side — From a point 10.5 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Queens Park Rise eastwards for a distance of 3 metres —
CPZ ‘LR”

Controlled Parking Zone Y

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Add new ltem 10a: Brunswick Row — Both sides — Whole Length — CPZ “Y”

After Part 1.1 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 1.3
No Waiting Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm

Item Side of .
No. Street Name Road Description CPZ

From the southern property boundary
| Sydney Street East | of no. 47 Sydney Street, northwards Y
for a distance of 20 metres

From a point opposite the northern
2 | Sydney Street West | kerbline of Gloucester Street, Y
northwards for a distance of |3 metres

From a point 3 metres north of the
northern property boundary of no. 15 Y
Sydney Street, southwards for a
distance of 16 metres

3 | Sydney Street West

From a point 20 metres south of the
4 | Sydney Street West | southern kerbline of Trafalgar Street, Y
’ southwards for a distance of 16 metres

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm
Delete Item 25: Sydney Street — East side from the southern property boundary of
no. 47 Sydney Street, northwards for a distance of 20 metres

Delete Item 26: Sydney Street — West side from a point opposite the northern
kerbline of Gloucester Street, northwards for a distance of 13 metres

Delete ltem 27: Sydney Street — West side from a point 3 metres north of the
northern property boundary of no. 15 Sydney Street, southwards for a distance of
16 metres

Delete Item 28: Sydney Street — West side from a point 20 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Trafalgar Street, southwards for a distance of 16 metres

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and
8pm inclusive
Amend Item 109 Rose Hill Terrace: delete “28 metres” and substitute “25 metres”



Part 5.15 Shared Permit Holders and Medium Tariff Medium Term Pay
& Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours)
from Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm

Amend Item 28 Union Road: delete “1 10 metres” and substitute “99 metres”.

Part 6.3 Exclusive Medium Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for
a period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to
Saturday between 9am and épm inclusive

Add new Item |4a: London Road — East side - From a point || metres south of the
southern boundary wall of no 78 London Road, southwards for a distance of 15.5
metres — CPZ “Y”

After Part 7.1 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 7.2
Doctors Parking 8am - 8pm on any day
Item Side of o
No. Street Name Road Description CPZ

From a point 99 metres east of the
I Union Road South | junction with Park Crescent Terrace, Y
eastwards for a distance of | | metres

Part | I.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time

Add new Item 31a: Rose Hill Terrace — North side - From a point 4.9 metres east of
the western boundary wall of No.i7 Rose Hill Terrace eastwards for a distance of 3
metres — CPZ “Y”

Part 12.1 Loading Only At Any Time

Delete Item 6: Guildford Road — South side — From a point 5.5 metres from the
junction with Buckingham Street westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Amend ltem 7 London Road: delete “34 metres” and substitute “I | metres”

After Part 12.7 insert a new Part to the Schedule as follows:

Part 12.11
Loading Only from Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm
item Side of ‘e
No. Street Name Road Description CPZ

From a point 5.5 metres from the
I Guildford Road | South | junction with Buckingham Street Y
westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Controlied Parking Zone Z

Part 2. No Loading At any Time
Add new ltem 7a: Duke Street — North side — From a point 6 metres south of the

boundary wall between Nos. 38 & 39 Duke Street southwards for a distance of 7
metres — CPZ “Z”

Amend Item 39 West Street: delete “35 metres” and substitute “32 metres”



Add new ltem 41: Windsor Street — East side — From the northern kerbline of the
access to the rear of Nos. 134-138 North Street northwards for a distance of 6
metres — CPZ “Z”

Part 2.6 No Loading Monday to Saturday 9am -6pm
Delete ltem 7: Castle Street — Both sides — From the eastern kerbline of Preston
Street, eastwards for a distance of 6 metres

Delete existing ltem 8: Castle Street — East side — From the northern boundary of
No.39 Castle Street northwards for a distance of 16 metres

Add new ltem 8: Castle Street — East and South side — From a point 16 metres north
of the northern boundary of No.39 Castle Street southwards then westwards to a
point 10 metres east of the east property boundary of No.30 Castle Street — CPZ
“Z”

Amend Item 9 Castle Street: delete “From a point 5 metres north of the northern
kerbline of Stone Street southwards to a” and substitute “From a”

Delete Item 10; Castle Street — East and South side — From a point 2 metres south
of the southern property boundary of No.38 Castle Street southwards and then
westwards to a point 10 metres east of the eastern property boundary of No.30
Castle Street

Delete existing ltem |1: Castle Street — West and North side — From the northern
property boundary of No.7 Castle Street southwards and then westwards to a point
I | metres east of the eastern property boundary of No.8 Castle Street

Add new Item 11: Castle Street — West and North side — From the southern
kerbline of Stone Street southwards then westwards to a point | | metres east of the
eastern property boundary of No.8 Castle Street — CPZ “Z”

Delete Item 16: Preston Street — East side — From a point é metres north of the
northern kerbline of Stone Street southwards to a point 6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Stone Street

Delete item |7: Preston Street — East side — From a point 6 metres north of the
northern kerbline Castle Street, southwards to a point 6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Stone Street

Delete Item 24: Stone Street — Both sides — From the eastern kerbline of Preston
Street eastwards for a distance of 6 metres

Amend ltem 28 West Street: delete “2 metres north of the southern property
boundary of No.67 West Street “ and substitute “26 metres south of the southern

kerbline of Boyces Street”

Amend ltem 33 West Street: delete “5 metres” and substitute “2.8 metres”



Part 6.4 Exclusive High Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a
period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to Sunday
between 9am and épm inclusive

Amend Item 26 Spring Gardens: delete “15 metres” and substitute “19.4 metres”,
delete “ 38 metres” and substitute “35.5 metres”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem 21a Regent Street: delete “I2 metres” and substitute “15.3 metres”

Part 9.4 Disabled Badge Holders Parking Places Maximum Length of
Stay 3 hours no return within | hour

Amend Item 2 Jubilee Street: delete “68 metres” and substitute “5| metres”, delete
“21 metres” and substitute “|19 metres”

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend Item 28 Spring Gardens” delete “9 metres” and substitute “10.9 metres”

delete “6 metres” and substitute “8.5 metres”

Part 12.1 Loading Bay At Any Time
Amend ltem |3a Jubilee Street: delete “4| metres” and substitute “43 metres”

Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm

Add new Item |: Clarence Square — Full width- From the eastern kerbline of Cannon
Place eastwards to the eastern end of Clarence Square — CPZ “Z”

Renumber existing Item | Regency Square as Item 2

Renumber existing Iltem 2 Regency Square as Item 3

Renumber existing Item 3 Regency Square as Item 4

Renumber existing Item 4 Regency Square as [tem 5

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON )
& HOVE CITY COUNCIL was affixed this )
22 ¥%ay of fflmu;i Two Thousand and Ten )
in the presence of

Wi /%/éﬁ)a

Authorised Person

10



